

**Bakersfield City School District
B.C.S.D Bid #23-05-02-B AWARD SHEET**

Food Service Equipment

BAKERSFIELD CITY SCHOOL DISTRICT - Food Service Equipment Bid 23-05-02-B		Kamran & Company, Inc.			Douglas Equipment		
Line#	Description	Unit Cost	Installation & Removal Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Installation & Removal Cost	Total Cost
1*	AIR CURTAIN FLY FAN LEADING EDGE # 3600-1150 RD W MODEL C1200 MICRO SWITCH	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2*	AIR CURTAIN FLY FAN - 72" LEADING EGDE # 3600-1125 RD W MODEL C1200 MICRO SWITCH	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3*	AIR CURTAIN FLY FAN, CURTON PRODUCTS MODEL NO AP-2-42-1-SS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	BLENDER, FOOD PROCESSOR VITA MIX VITA-PREP 3 COMMERCIAL FOOD BLENDER 64	\$ 648.00	No Bid	\$ 648.00	\$ 435.17	No Bid	\$ 435.17
5	BLENDER, FOOD PROCESSOR - COMMERCIAL 64 OZ, NSF APPROVED HAMILTON MODEL NO. HBF-600 OR EQUAL	\$ 752.00	No Bid	\$ 752.00	\$ 602.56	No Bid	\$ 602.56
6*	BOOSTER, HEATER HATCO MODEL NO. C-15-208-3-QS	\$ 2,865.00	\$ 1,250.00	\$ 4,115.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7	CABINET, HEATED, MOBILE - FULL SIZE, 1-DOOR, POLYMER COLORED COATING REMOVAL OF OLD UNIT METRO MODEL NO. C539-HFS-U	\$ 2,908.00	No Bid	\$ 2,908.00	\$ 3,468.29	No Bid	\$ 3,468.29
8	CABINET, HEATED - MOBILE, FULL SIZE, 2-DOOR, STAINLESS STEEL, REMOVAL OF OLD UNIT METRO MODEL NO. C569-SDS-U	\$ 5,542.00	No Bid	\$ 5,542.00	\$ 6,594.38	No Bid	\$ 6,594.38
9	CABINET, HEATED - MOBILE - FULL SIZE, DOOR-PASS THRU, DUTCH SOLID, STAINLESS STEEL REMOVAL OF OLD UNIT METRO MODEL NO. C589-SDS-UPDS	\$ 6,538.00	No Bid	\$ 6,538.00	\$ 7,819.94	No Bid	\$ 7,819.94
10	CAMCRUISER, KIOSK VENDING CART CAMBRO MODEL NO. CVC724	\$ 4,227.00	No Bid	\$ 4,257.00	\$ 4,055.20	No Bid	\$ 4,055.20
11	CAN OPENER, ELECTRIC - HEAVY DUTY, 2 SPEED, 115v, NSF APPROVED EDLUND MODEL NO. 270	\$ 1,709.00	No Bid	\$ 1,709.00	\$ 1,504.26	No Bid	\$ 1,504.26
12	CAN OPENER - ELECTRIC - 2 SPEED, 115v EDLUND MODEL NO. 203	\$ 846.00	No Bid	\$ 846.00	\$ 757.88	No Bid	\$ 757.88
13	CAN OPENER- MANUAL - WITH 16" ADJUSTABLE BAR & CLAMP BASE, NSF APPROVED EDLUND MODEL NO. S-11C	\$ 595.00	No Bid	\$ 595.00	\$ 513.79	No Bid	\$ 513.79
14	CART, MACHINE STAND - WITH 4" SWIVEL CASTERS (2 LOCKING) LAKESIDE MODEL NO. 518	\$ 1,323.00	No Bid	\$ 1,323.00	\$ 1,205.46	No Bid	\$ 1,205.46
15	CART, UTILITY - 18"X 27", WITH PERIMETER BUMPER, NSF APPROVED LAKESIDE MODEL NO. 521 - WITH 4 SWIVEL CASTERS	\$ 1,417.00	No Bid	\$ 1,417.00	\$ 940.24	No Bid	\$ 940.24
16	CART, UTILITY - 24" X 48", NSF APPROVED LAKESIDE MODEL NO. 953	\$ 2,097.00	No Bid	\$ 2,097.00	\$ 2,075.83	No Bid	\$ 2,075.83
17	CART, UTILITY - 31 1/2 X 16 X 36, VOLLRATH MODEL NO. 97166 (3 SHELF)	\$ 752.00	No Bid	\$ 752.00	\$ 499.09	No Bid	\$ 499.09
18	CART, UTILITY - 40 1/2 X 21X 36, VOLLRATH MODEL NO. 97167 (3 SHELF)	\$ 1,842.00	No Bid	\$ 1,842.00	\$ 718.81	No Bid	\$ 718.81
19	CART, UTILITY- 40 1/2 X 21 X 36 VOLLRATH 97161 (2 SHELF)	\$ 1,671.00	No Bid	\$ 1,671.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
20*	DISHMACHINE, HIGH CAPACITY, HIGH/LOW TEMPERATURE AMERICAN DISH SERVICE MODEL NO. 5AG OR EQUAL	\$ 7,654.00	\$ 1,780.00	\$ 9,434.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

**Bakersfield City School District
B.C.S.D Bid #23-05-02-B AWARD SHEET**

Food Service Equipment

BAKERSFIELD CITY SCHOOL DISTRICT - Food Service Equipment Bid 23-05-02-B		Kamran & Company, Inc.			Douglas Equipment		
Line#	Description	Unit Cost	Installation & Removal Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Installation & Removal Cost	Total Cost
21*	DISHMACHINE, S-C Scullery Low Temperature Dishmachine, CMA CMA MODEL:S-C or Equal	\$ 5,369.00	\$ 1,780.00	\$ 7,149.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
22*	DISHMACHINE, HIGH CAPACITY, HIGH TEMPERATURE HOBART MODEL NO. AM 15T + BUILD UP	\$ 18,207.00	\$ 1,780.00	\$ 19,987.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
23*	DISHMACHINE, LOW TEMP AFB BAKERY CORNER AMERICAN DISH SERVICE MODEL NO: AF-3D,AFB,AF or Equal	\$ 5,944.00	\$ 1,780.00	\$ 7,724.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
24*	DISHMACHINE,HIGH TEMPERATURE SINGLE RACK-SPLIT DOOR CORNER MODEL 180-TC or Equal	\$ 10,381.00	\$ 1,780.00	\$ 12,161.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
25	FOODPROCESSOR, W/FC25+FCC3+FMC 25 SAMMIC MODEL NO. CA-301	\$ 2,202.00	No Bid	\$ 2,202.00	\$ 2,050.69	No Bid	\$ 2,050.69
26	FOODPROCESSOR, ROBOT COUPE R2N COMBINATION FOOD PROCESSOR WITH 3QT.GRAY BOWL,CONTINUOUS FEED & 2 DISCS-1HP	\$ 1,295.00	No Bid	\$ 1,295.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
27*	FREEZER, REACH-IN 2 DOOR, WITH 6" CASTERS (REMOVAL OF OLD UNIT) TRAULSEN MODEL NO. ALT-232-NUT-FHS	\$ 17,699.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 18,449.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
28*	FREEZER, REACH-IN, 2 DOOR (REMOVAL OF OLD UNIT) TRUE MODEL NO. STR2F-25 WITH KIT #3	\$ 10,190.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 10,940.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
29*	FREEZER, REACH-IN - 3 SECTION UNIT WITH 6" CASTERS (REMOVAL OF OLD UNIT) UTILITY REFRIGERATOR MODEL NO. F-90-SS-1S-D	\$ 16,455.00	\$ 950.00	\$ 17,405.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
30*	FREEZER, REACH-IN - 2 SECTION WITH 6" CASTERS (REMOVAL OF OLD UNIT) UTILITY REFRIGERATOR MODEL NO. F-60-SS-2S-D	\$ 11,513.00	\$ 850.00	\$ 12,363.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
31	KNIFE SHARPENER - HEAVY COMMERCIAL, 110V HCA TRU HONE MODEL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
32	IMERSION BLENDER - 12", HEAVY DUTY, VARIABLE SPEED, 10 GALLON/40 QT CAPACITY WARING MODEL NO. WSB50 OR EQUAL	\$ 527.00	No Bid	\$ 527.00	\$ 455.48	No Bid	\$ 455.48
33	MICROWAVE, COMMERCIAL AMANA MODEL NO. RCS10DSE OR EQUAL	\$ 497.00	No Bid	\$ 490.00	\$ 462.81	No Bid	\$ 462.81
34	MILK COOLER - 8 CASE CAPACITY, 2 DOOR (REMOVAL OF OLD UNIT) BEVERAGE AIR MODEL NO. ST34NS	\$ 3,075.00	\$ 590.00	\$ 3,665.00	\$ 3,480.37	No Bid	\$ 3,480.37
35	MILK COOLER - 12 CASE CAPACITY, 2 DOOR (REMOVAL OF OLD UNIT) BEVERAGE AIR MODEL NO. ST49N	\$ 3,500.00	\$ 590.00	\$ 4,090.00	\$ 3,918.87	No Bid	\$ 3,918.87
36	MILK COOLER - 16 CASE CAPACITY, 2 DOOR (REMOVAL OF OLD UNIT) BEVERAGE AIR MODEL NO. ST58NS	\$ 4,060.00	\$ 590.00	\$ 4,650.00	\$ 4,326.45	No Bid	\$ 4,326.45
37	MILK COOLER - 8 CASE CAPACITY, 1 DOOR (REMOVAL OF OLD UNIT) BEVERAGE AIR MODEL NO. SM34NS	\$ 2,700.00	\$ 590.00	\$ 3,290.00	\$ 2,939.37	No Bid	\$ 2,939.37
38	MILK COOLER - 12 CASE CAPACITY, 1 DOOR (REMOVAL OF OLD UNIT) BEVERAGE AIR MODEL NO. SM49NS	\$ 3,150.00	\$ 590.00	\$ 3,740.00	\$ 3,361.18	No Bid	\$ 3,361.18

Bakersfield City School District
B.C.S.D Bid #23-05-02-B AWARD SHEET

Food Service Equipment

BAKERSFIELD CITY SCHOOL DISTRICT - Food Service Equipment Bid 23-05-02-B		Kamran & Company, Inc.			Douglas Equipment		
Line#	Description	Unit Cost	Installation & Removal Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Installation & Removal Cost	Total Cost
39	MILK COOLER - 16 CASE CAPACITY, 1 DOOR (REMOVAL OF OLD UNIT) BEVERAGE AIR MODEL NO. SM58NS	\$ 3,520.00	\$ 590.00	\$ 4,110.00	\$ 4,075.41	No Bid	\$ 4,075.41
40	MILK COOLER - 8 CASE CAPACITY, 2 DOOR (REMOVAL OF OLD UNIT) TRAULSEN MODEL NO. RMC34D6	\$ 6,424.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 7,174.00	\$ 5,140.20	No Bid	\$ 5,140.20
41	MIXER, TABLE TOP - 5 QUART HOBART MODEL NO. N50	\$ 3,722.00	No Bid	\$ 3,722.00	\$ 3,678.09	No Bid	\$ 3,678.09
42	MIXER, TABLE TOP - 10 QUART HOBART MODEL NO. HS10	\$ 6,614.00	No Bid	\$ 6,614.00	\$ 6,711.17	No Bid	\$ 6,711.17
43	MIXER, FLOOR - 30 QUART WITH ATTACHMENTS HOBART MODEL NO. HL300	\$ 13,152.00	No Bid	\$ 13,152.00	\$ 13,196.68	No Bid	\$ 13,196.68
44*	OVEN, CONVECTION, DOUBLE DECK - 2 SPEED, STAINLESS STEEL SIDES & LEGS MONTAGUE MODEL NO. 2-115A	\$ 22,768.00	\$ 1,550.00	\$ 24,318.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
45*	OVEN, CONVECTION, DOUBLE DECK - 2 SPEED, STAINLESS STEEL SIDES, 5" CASTERS, FLEXIBLE GAS QUICK DISCONNECT KIT, MANIFOLD ASSY. FOR 3/4" NPT GAS MONTAGUE MODEL NO. HX2-63A	\$ 23,506.00	\$ 1,550.00	\$ 25,056.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
46*	OVEN, CONVECTION, DOUBLE DECK - 2 SPEED, STAINLESS STEEL SIDES, 6" CASTERS, 48" QUICK DISCONNECT KIT, MANIFOLD ASSY. FOR 3/4" NPT GAS, SOLID STATE MANUAL CONTROLS, STAINLESS STEEL DOORS, EXTENDED WARRANTY BLODGETT MODEL ZEPHAIRE - G PLUS	\$ 15,741.00	\$ 1,550.00	\$ 17,291.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
47	RACK, CAN - 54 CAN CAPACITY WITH CASTERS WIN HOLT MODEL NO. CR-54	\$ 835.00	No Bid	\$ 835.00	\$ 579.00	No Bid	\$ 579.00
48	RACK, CAN - 72 CAN CAPACITY WITH CASTERS WIN HOLT MODEL NO. CR-72	\$ 835.00	No Bid	\$ 835.00	\$ 586.56	No Bid	\$ 586.56
49	RACK, CAN - 162 CAN CAPACITY WITH CASTERS WIN HOLT MODEL NO. CR162M	\$ 1,052.00	No Bid	\$ 1,052.00	\$ 779.33	No Bid	\$ 779.33
50	RACK, CAN - 72 CAN CAPACITY WITH CASTERS NEW AGE MODEL NO. 1225	\$ 1,121.00	No Bid	\$ 1,121.00	\$ 806.79	No Bid	\$ 806.79
51	RACK, DRYING, CAMBRO CAMSHELVING VERTICAL DRYING RACK MODEL : EMU244878DRPKG	\$ 1,003.00	No Bid	\$ 1,003.00	\$ 876.16	No Bid	\$ 876.16
52	RACK, PAN (OPEN) - MOBILE, FRONT LOAD WIN HOLT MODEL NO. AL1820-N	\$ 755.00	No Bid	\$ 755.00	\$ 546.15	No Bid	\$ 546.15
53	RACK, PAN (OPEN) - MOBILE, FRONT LOAD NEW AGE MODEL NO. 4331	\$ 1,475.00	No Bid	\$ 1,475.00	\$ 1,108.28	No Bid	\$ 1,108.28
54	RACK, PAN (OPEN) - MOBILE, SIDE LOAD WIN HOLT # EDEL820B-KDA 20# WIN-AL2620B	\$ 552.00	No Bid	\$ 552.00	\$ 280.23	No Bid	\$ 280.23

**Bakersfield City School District
B.C.S.D Bid #23-05-02-B AWARD SHEET**

Food Service Equipment

BAKERSFIELD CITY SCHOOL DISTRICT - Food Service Equipment Bid 23-05-02-B		Kamran & Company, Inc.			Douglas Equipment		
Line#	Description	Unit Cost	Installation & Removal Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Installation & Removal Cost	Total Cost
55*	RANGE, GAS - 16", CABINET BASE MODEL NO. P16C-X	\$ 5,266.00	\$ 850.00	\$ 6,116.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
56*	RANGE, GAS - 36", 4 BURNER SOUTHBEND MODEL NO. 4367D	\$ 5,701.00	\$ 850.00	\$ 6,551.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
57*	RANGE, GAS - 36", 6 BURNER, 2-DOOR WITH OPEN CABINET BASE MONTAGUE MODEL NO. 36-5	\$ 7,566.00	\$ 950.00	\$ 8,416.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
58*	RANGE, GAS - 18", 2 BURNER, CASTERS MONTAGUE MODEL NO. 18-5A	\$ 5,530.00	\$ 650.00	\$ 6,180.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
59	REFRIGERATOR, REACH-IN, 2 SECTION UNIT, 6" CASTERS, #4 TRAYSLIDES FOR 1/2 SECTION REMOVAL OF OLD UNIT TRAUlsen MODEL NO. AHT-232-NUT-FHS	\$ 15,805.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 16,555.00	\$ 12,340.60	No Bid	\$ 12,340.60
60	REFRIGERATOR, REACH-IN 2 SECTION UNIT TRUE STR2R-25 + KIT #3	\$ 7,972.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 8,722.00	\$ 8,851.29	No Bid	\$ 8,851.29
61	REFRIGERATOR, REACH-IN-1 SECTION UNIT, WITH #4 TRAY SLIDES FOR 1/2 SECTION (REMOVAL OF OLD UNIT) TRAUlsen MODEL NO. G10010	\$ 5,031.00	\$ 580.00	\$ 5,611.00	\$ 5,876.45	No Bid	\$ 5,876.45
62	REFRIGERATOR, REACH-IN-2 SECTION UNIT WITH TRAY SLIDES 1 SECTION, 6" CASTERS (REMOVAL OF OLD UNIT) UTILITY REFRIGERATOR MODEL NO. R-60-SS-2S-D	\$ 11,715.00	\$ 850.00	\$ 12,565.00	\$ 11,246.97	No Bid	\$ 11,246.97
63	REFRIGERATOR, REACH-IN-3 SECTION UNIT WITH TRAY SLIDES 1 SECTION, 6" CASTERS (REMOVAL OF OLD UNIT) UTILITY REFRIGERATOR MODEL NO. R-90-SS-3S-D	\$ 15,584.00	\$ 950.00	\$ 16,534.00	\$ 15,042.45	No Bid	\$ 15,042.45
64	SCALE, BAKER DOUGH-8 LB. WITH SCOOP DETECTO MODEL NO. 1052TBS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
65*	SHELVING UNIT, PLASTIC WITH POLY EXTERIOR STEEL POSTS- CAMBRO MODEL NO. CPA 184872V4480	\$ 620.00	\$ 650.00	\$ 1,270.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
66*	SKILLET, TILTING - 40 GALLON CAPACITY, NATURAL GAS, 9" PAN (REMOVAL OF OLD UNIT) GROEN MODEL NO. 3I HFP/2-4	\$ 20,440.00	\$ 1,550.00	\$ 21,990.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
67*	SKILLET, TILTING-40 GALLON CAPACITY SOUTHBEND MODEL NO. BGLM-40	\$ 26,978.00	\$ 1,550.00	\$ 28,528.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
68*	SKILLET, TILTING-48", 40 GALLON CAPACITY, WITH MOTOR DRIVEN PAN LIFT (REMOVAL OF OLD UNIT) VULCAN MODEL NO. VG40	\$ 28,254.00	\$ 1,550.00	\$ 29,804.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
69	SLICER, FOOD - HEAVY DUTY, MANUAL HOBART MODEL NO. 3613+BUILDUP	\$ 6,722.00	No Bid	\$ 6,722.00	\$ 6,721.07	No Bid	\$ 6,721.07
70	SLICER, FOOD-MANUAL WITH THE WORKS HOBART MODEL NO. 2612	\$ 5,987.00	No Bid	\$ 5,987.00	\$ 6,012.44	No Bid	\$ 6,012.44
71	SLICER, FOOD - 10" MANUAL BERKEL MODEL NO. 825E OR EQUAL	\$ 1,076.00	No Bid	\$ 1,076.00	\$ 964.49	No Bid	\$ 964.49
72	SLICER, FOOD-AUTOMATIC, 13" KNIFE HOBART MODEL NO. HS9	\$ 11,117.00	No Bid	\$ 11,117.00	\$ 10,962.78	No Bid	\$ 10,962.78
73	SUNKIST S-103 COMMERCIAL SECTIONIZER WITH 6-SLICE ATTACHMENT	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
74	VERSA FOOD (SALAD) BAR-6" WITH HEAVY-DUTY CASTERS, BLACK CAMBRO MODEL NO. VBRHD-6 110	\$ 3,872.00	No Bid	\$ 3,872.00	\$ 2,490.88	No Bid	\$ 2,490.88
75	VERSA FOOD(SALAD) BAR-6", LOW HEIGHT WITH HEAVY DUTY CASTERS, BLACK CAMBRO MODEL NO. VBLHD-6	\$ 3,872.00	No Bid	\$ 3,872.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
76*	1HP DISPOSAL BASE UNIT SMALL CAPA SS-100-28 115/208-230V 1HP	\$ 1,864.00	\$ 2,200.00	\$ 4,064.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
77*	INSINKERATOR SS-100-280 COMMERCIAL GARBAGE DISPOSER -1HP, 1 PHASE	\$ 4,594.00	\$ 2,200.00	\$ 6,794.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Bakersfield City School District
B.C.S.D Bid #23-05-02-B AWARD SHEET

Food Service Equipment

BAKERSFIELD CITY SCHOOL DISTRICT - Food Service Equipment Bid 23-05-02-B		Kamran & Company, Inc.			Douglas Equipment		
Line#	Description	Unit Cost	Installation & Removal Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Installation & Removal Cost	Total Cost
78*	WASTE KING 1000-1 1 HP COMMERCIAL FOOD WASTE DISPOSER, GRAY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
79*	RATIONAL 60.73.768 STACKING KIT FOR DUO XS COMB1 OVENS WITH RIGHT SIDE HINGES	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
80*	ALTO-SHAAM CTC10-10G COMBITHERM NATURAL GAS BOILER - FREE 11 PAN COMB1 OVEN-120V	\$ 22,592.00	\$ 2,579.00	\$ 25,171.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

NOTES:

- 1.) Product awarded by line item as highlighted in green.
- 2.) Non Responsive highlighted in orange: Installation Required
- 3.) No Bid highlighted gray